
Bewood Unique case for Samsung Galaxy A55 5G Turquoise with MagSafe
GSM188537
5906306015913
BWD14551

The most important features: - 100% protection - Made of natural wood and resin - Compatible with Apple MagSafe accessories (optional) - Works
with magnetic car mounts (optional) - Compatible with wireless chargers (QI technology) - Does not interfere with contactless payment signals -
Compatible with front protective glass - Lightweight, does not bulk up the phone - TPU silicone hugging the sides of the phone from all four sides -
Shock-absorbing material - Perfectly fitted to the shape of the phone - Non-slip layer ensuring a secure grip - Easy access to the charging port,
buttons, and ports - Carefully designed button embossing - Handcrafted wood processing and finishing - Precision workmanship - Warranty: 12
months * The purchased item may slightly differ from the one shown in the photos. Remember!!! You are buying a unique item. There are no two
identical pieces. Bewood Unique Case - Wood & Resin One of a kind - a few words about the production process: A selected piece of burl is placed
in a special container, then filled with colored resin. The colors are combined either beforehand or only after pouring, depending on the effect
desired. The liquid seeps into all the crevices of the burl, ultimately creating patterns - unique, sometimes mysterious, and evoking various
associations. Such a formed piece must be properly cared for to eliminate the risk of air bubbles forming. After some time, when the resin hardens
and the entire form achieves its final, compact, and hardened structure, the next stage can begin, which is the machine processing of the wood and
laser cutting. Next, an eco-friendly oil layer is applied to the carefully sanded surface of the wood with resin. After a few hours, the wood absorbs most
of the oil, and any excess is wiped off with a cloth. The final stage is polishing - gently, to achieve an elegant, satin finish on the case. Each case is
produced individually. This guarantees the complete uniqueness of the product. Rejected, unnecessary pieces of wood - a second life: To create a
case that combines resin and wood, appropriately prepared pieces of wood are needed. All Unique patterns are a synthesis of chance, ingenuity,
and above all, nature, specifically wood in the form of burls, which are unwanted swellings of the tree trunk. Elements with such deformities are
immediately rejected in the furniture industry or in the production of musical instruments. What is bad for the industry and not necessarily good for the
tree itself turns out to be an extremely interesting raw material for further processing in the creation of unique phone cases. Burl wood attracts
attention with its rich shapes and unique texture. Unique - according to the Polish language dictionary, it is an item: exceptional, special, rarely
encountered, one of a kind, extraordinary, remarkable, unparalleled. Such are the cases from the Unique series - nothing to add, nothing to take
away.

Specification

Brand: Bewood
Complies with: Phones / smartphones/Samsung/Galaxy

A55 5G
Colour: multicoloured

Packages type: box
Warranty: 12 month

 

SCAN ME!

https://sklep.telforceone.pl/gfx/invent/oryg/439245_oryg.jpg
https://sklep.telforceone.pl/en-gb/product/2324887/2326252/bewood-unique-case-for-samsung-galaxy-a55-5g-turquoise-with-magsafe

	Bewood Unique case for Samsung Galaxy A55 5G Turquoise with MagSafe
	Specification

